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In the winter of 1922-23 archaeologist Howard Carter and his wealthy patron George Herbert, the Fifth Earl
of Carnarvon, sensationally opened the tomb of Tutenkhamen. Six weeks later Herbert, the sponsor of the
expedition, died in Egypt. The popular press went wild with rumours of a curse on those who disturbed the
Pharaoh's rest and for years followed every twist and turn of the fate of the men who had been involved in
the historic discovery. Long dismissed by Egyptologists, the mummy's curse remains a part of popular
supernatural belief. Roger Luckhurst explores why the myth has captured the British imagination across the
centuries, and how it has impacted on popular culture.

Tutankhamen was not the first curse story to emerge in British popular culture. This book uncovers the 'true'
stories of two extraordinary Victorian gentlemen widely believed at the time to have been cursed by the
artefacts they brought home from Egypt in the nineteenth century. These are weird and wonderful stories that
weave together a cast of famous writers, painters, feted soldiers, lowly smugglers, respected men of science,
disreputable society dames, and spooky spiritualists. Focusing on tales of the curse myth, Roger Luckhurst
leads us through Victorian museums, international exhibitions, private collections, the battlefields of Egypt
and Sudan, and the writings of figures like Arthur Conan Doyle, Rider Haggard and Algernon Blackwood.
Written in an open and accessible style, this volume is the product of over ten years research in London's
most curious archives. It explores how we became fascinated with Egypt and how this fascination was
fuelled by myth, mystery, and rumour. Moreover, it provides a new and startling path through the cultural
history of Victorian England and its colonial possessions.
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From reader reviews:

Melba More:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive right now, people have
do something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place and
notice simply by surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated the idea for a
while is reading. Yep, by reading a book your ability to survive improve then having chance to stand up than
other is high. To suit your needs who want to start reading a book, we give you this particular The Mummy's
Curse: The True History of a Dark Fantasy book as nice and daily reading reserve. Why, because this book is
greater than just a book.

Jesus Loveless:

Typically the book The Mummy's Curse: The True History of a Dark Fantasy will bring you to definitely the
new experience of reading any book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique. If you try to find
new book you just read, this book very suited to you. The book The Mummy's Curse: The True History of a
Dark Fantasy is much recommended to you to learn. You can also get the e-book through the official web
site, so you can more easily to read the book.

Donald Sigman:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything we wish. A book is a list of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year was
exactly added. This publication The Mummy's Curse: The True History of a Dark Fantasy was filled
concerning science. Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your technology competence. Some
people has several feel when they reading some sort of book. If you know how big benefit of a book, you can
experience enjoy to read a publication. In the modern era like today, many ways to get book that you simply
wanted.

Ruth Hill:

Some individuals said that they feel bored when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt this when they
get a half areas of the book. You can choose often the book The Mummy's Curse: The True History of a
Dark Fantasy to make your own personal reading is interesting. Your own skill of reading talent is
developing when you similar to reading. Try to choose basic book to make you enjoy to see it and mingle the
opinion about book and studying especially. It is to be initially opinion for you to like to start a book and
read it. Beside that the publication The Mummy's Curse: The True History of a Dark Fantasy can to be your
new friend when you're sense alone and confuse with what must you're doing of these time.
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