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The Ethics of Private Practice helps mental health professionals understand the essential ethical issues
related to the many challenges of being in independent practice. Seasoned clinicians Barnett, Zimmerman,
and Walfish offer readers astute insight into building a practice that is designed to minimize unintended
ethics violations and reduce associated risks. Each chapter focuses on a major aspect of the business of
practice and incorporates relevant standards from the ethics codes of four mental health professions. Topics
addressed include planning and successfully managing a practice, documentation and record keeping,
dealing with third parties and protecting confidentiality, managing practice finances, staff training and office
policies, advertising and marketing a practice, continuing professional development activities, and the
closing of a private practice. Full of practical tips that can be readily implemented, this handy guide will be
the go-to resource for all mental health clinicians in private practice.
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From reader reviews:

Kirk Fonseca:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important work, like
looking for your favorite e-book and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add your
knowledge by the guide entitled The Ethics of Private Practice: A Practical Guide for Mental Health
Clinicians. Try to face the book The Ethics of Private Practice: A Practical Guide for Mental Health
Clinicians as your pal. It means that it can for being your friend when you truly feel alone and beside that of
course make you smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you. The book makes you far more
confidence because you can know every little thing by the book. So , let us make new experience in addition
to knowledge with this book.

Pam Gray:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive today, people
have do something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place
and notice by surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated that for a while is
reading. Yes, by reading a guide your ability to survive boost then having chance to stay than other is high.
In your case who want to start reading the book, we give you this specific The Ethics of Private Practice: A
Practical Guide for Mental Health Clinicians book as basic and daily reading book. Why, because this book
is greater than just a book.

Holly Walker:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the free time or they will get wide
range of stress from both daily life and work. So , when we ask do people have free time, we will say
absolutely of course. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity
do you possess when the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer will certainly unlimited
right. Then do you ever try this one, reading guides. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time,
typically the book you have read is The Ethics of Private Practice: A Practical Guide for Mental Health
Clinicians.

Haley Berg:

Does one one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Make an
effort to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't ascertain book by its cover may doesn't
work at this point is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the
outside appear likes. Maybe you answer can be The Ethics of Private Practice: A Practical Guide for Mental
Health Clinicians why because the great cover that make you consider about the content will not disappoint
anyone. The inside or content will be fantastic as the outside or cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly
guide you to pick up this book.
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