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From Possess author Gretchen McNeil comes this teen horror novel inspired by Agatha Christie’s And Then
There Were None. Perfect for fans of Christopher Pike’s Chain Letter and Lois Duncan’s I Know What You
Did Last Summer, Ten will keep readers on the edge of their seats until the very last page!

It was supposed to be the weekend of their lives—an exclusive house party on Henry Island. Best friends
Meg and Minnie are looking forward to two days of boys, booze, and fun-filled luxury. But what starts out as
fun turns twisted after the discovery of a DVD with a sinister message: Vengeance is mine. And things only
get worse from there.

With a storm raging outside, the teens are cut off from the outside world . . . so when a mysterious killer
begins picking them off one by one, there’s no escape. As the deaths become more violent and the teens turn
on one another, can Meg find the killer before more people die? Or is the killer closer to her than she could
ever imagine?
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From reader reviews:

Anna Thompson:

In other case, little folks like to read book Ten. You can choose the best book if you appreciate reading a
book. Given that we know about how is important some sort of book Ten. You can add information and of
course you can around the world by just a book. Absolutely right, mainly because from book you can know
everything! From your country right up until foreign or abroad you will be known. About simple factor until
wonderful thing you can know that. In this era, you can open a book as well as searching by internet unit. It
is called e-book. You may use it when you feel bored to go to the library. Let's examine.

Michael Hollinger:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also become a life style. This reading
practice give you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge the particular
information inside the book in which improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get
based on what kind of book you read, if you want attract knowledge just go with education books but if you
want sense happy read one using theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. The Ten is kind of e-book
which is giving the reader unforeseen experience.

Mary Brown:

A lot of people always spent their particular free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them
family or their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, or
playing video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity that is look different you can read
any book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book which you read you can spent 24 hours a day to
reading a e-book. The book Ten it is extremely good to read. There are a lot of people who recommended
this book. They were enjoying reading this book. If you did not have enough space to deliver this book you
can buy the actual e-book. You can m0ore easily to read this book from the smart phone. The price is not too
expensive but this book features high quality.

Eric Kyler:

Reading a book to be new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to read a book. When you go
through a book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge,
due to the fact book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of
book that you have read. If you want to get information about your review, you can read education books,
but if you act like you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, these kinds of us novel,
comics, as well as soon. The Ten provide you with new experience in reading through a book.
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