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This book is designed to serve senior-level engineering students taking a capstone design course in fluid and
thermal systems design. It is built from the ground up with the needs and interests of practicing engineers in
mind; the emphasis is on practical applications. The book begins with a discussion of design methodology,
including the process of bidding to obtain a project, and project management techniques. The text continues
with an introductory overview of fluid thermal systems (a pump and pumping system, a household air
conditioner, a baseboard heater, a water slide, and a vacuum cleaner are among the examples given), and a
review of the properties of fluids and the equations of fluid mechanics. The text then offers an in-depth
discussion of piping systems, including the economics of pipe size selection. Janna examines pumps
(including net positive suction head considerations) and piping systems. He provides the reader with the
ability to design an entire system for moving fluids that is efficient and cost-effective. Next, the book
provides a review of basic heat transfer principles, and the analysis of heat exchangers, including double
pipe, shell and tube, plate and frame cross flow heat exchangers. Design considerations for these exchangers
are also discussed. The text concludes with a chapter of term projects that may be undertaken by teams of
students.
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From reader reviews:

Alan Williams:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? That's why,
you can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to
take a move, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or maybe read a book called Design
of Fluid Thermal Systems - SI Version? Maybe it is to become best activity for you. You already know
beside you can spend your time using your favorite's book, you can more intelligent than before. Do you
agree with its opinion or you have various other opinion?

Madeline Pastrana:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With looking at you can get a
lot of information which will give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world can share their
idea. Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire all their reader with their story or
perhaps their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the guides. But also they write about advantage
about something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your children,
there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors nowadays always try to improve their ability in
writing, they also doing some research before they write to their book. One of them is this Design of Fluid
Thermal Systems - SI Version.

Sheila Lefevre:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you will have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try issue that really
opposite from that. Just one activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you already been ride on and with addition details. Even you love Design of Fluid Thermal Systems -
SI Version, you could enjoy both. It is excellent combination right, you still would like to miss it? What kind
of hangout type is it? Oh seriously its mind hangout people. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its known as
reading friends.

Gordon Miller:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside having friends, fun activity along with family or just
watching TV all day every day. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by looking at a book.
Ugh, ya think reading a book will surely hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It fine you can
have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Design of Fluid Thermal Systems
- SI Version which is having the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's notice.
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