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An ideal text for graduate level courses in transport phenomena for chemical engineers, Analysis of
Transport Phenomena provides a unified treatment of momentum, heat, and mass transfer, emphasizing the
concepts and analytical techniques that apply to all of these transport processes.
The first few chapters establish the tools needed for later analyses while also covering heat and mass transfer
in stationary media. The similarities among the molecular or diffusive transport mechanisms--heat
conduction, diffusion of chemical species, and viscous transfer of momentum--are highlighted. Conservation
equations for scalar quantites are derived first in general form, and then used to obtain the governing
equations for total mass, energy, and chemical species. The scaling and order-of-magnitude concepts which
are crucial in modeling are also introduced. Certain key methods for solving the differential equations in
transport problems, including similarity, perturbation, and finite Fourier transform techniques, are described
using conduction and diffusion problems as examples.
Following chapters are devoted to fluid mechanics, beginning with fundamental equations for momentum
transfer and then discussing unidirectional flow, nearly unidirectional (lubrication) flow, creeping flow, and
laminar boundary layer flow. Forced-convection heat and mass transfer in laminar flow, multicomponent
energy and mass transfer, free convection, and turbulence are also covered. The appendix summarizes vector
and tensor operations and relations involving various coordinate systems.
Based on twenty years of teaching and extensive class testing, Analysis of Transport Phenomena offers
students both extensive coverage of the topic and inclusion of modern examples from bioengineering,
membrane science, and materials processing. It is mathematically self-contained and is also unique in its
treatment of scaling and approximation techniques and its presentation of the finite Fourier transform method
for solving partial differential equations.
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From reader reviews:

Neil Turner:

The book Analysis of Transport Phenomena (Topics in Chemical Engineering) make one feel enjoy for your
spare time. You can use to make your capable a lot more increase. Book can to become your best friend
when you getting strain or having big problem with your subject. If you can make examining a book
Analysis of Transport Phenomena (Topics in Chemical Engineering) for being your habit, you can get more
advantages, like add your own personal capable, increase your knowledge about some or all subjects. You
are able to know everything if you like wide open and read a reserve Analysis of Transport Phenomena
(Topics in Chemical Engineering). Kinds of book are several. It means that, science e-book or encyclopedia
or other individuals. So , how do you think about this guide?

Virginia Carter:

The book Analysis of Transport Phenomena (Topics in Chemical Engineering) can give more knowledge
and information about everything you want. So just why must we leave the best thing like a book Analysis of
Transport Phenomena (Topics in Chemical Engineering)? Several of you have a different opinion about
reserve. But one aim which book can give many info for us. It is absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer
using your book. Knowledge or details that you take for that, it is possible to give for each other; it is
possible to share all of these. Book Analysis of Transport Phenomena (Topics in Chemical Engineering) has
simple shape nevertheless, you know: it has great and large function for you. You can appear the enormous
world by available and read a book. So it is very wonderful.

Terry Crabtree:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by connect to the internet
and the resources inside can be true or not call for people to be aware of each details they get. How a lot
more to be smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the solution is reading a book. Looking
at a book can help individuals out of this uncertainty Information especially this Analysis of Transport
Phenomena (Topics in Chemical Engineering) book because book offers you rich info and knowledge. Of
course the info in this book hundred % guarantees there is no doubt in it you may already know.

Daryl Sanders:

Many people spending their period by playing outside along with friends, fun activity along with family or
just watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by studying a book. Ugh,
ya think reading a book really can hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It all right you can
have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like Analysis of Transport
Phenomena (Topics in Chemical Engineering) which is getting the e-book version. So , try out this book?
Let's notice.
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