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Basil Bernstein: The Thinker and the Field provides a comprehensive introduction to the work of Basil
Bernstein, demonstrating his distinctive contribution to social theory by locating it within the historical
context of the development of the sociology of education and Sociology in Britain. Although Bernstein had a
particular interest in education, he did not see himself as a sociologist of education alone. By exploring
Bernstein’s intellectually collaborative character and the evolving system of ideas, drawing upon
anthropology and linguistics, the originality of Bernstein’s contribution to the social sciences can be truly
identified.

Rob Moore’s text offers a provocative and challenging account both of Bernstein, and of British sociology
and education, approaching Bernstein’s work as a complex model of intertwining ideas rather than a single
theory. Continued interest in Bernstein’s work has opened up a world-wide network of scholarship, and
Moore considers contemporary research alongside classical sources in Durkheim and Marx, to provide a
historical analysis of the fields of British Sociology and the sociology of education, pinpointing Bernstein’s
position within them.

The book is organised into two main parts:

The Field

Background and Beginnings●

Durkheim, Cosmology and Education●

The Problematic

The Structure of Pedagogic Discourse●

Bernstein and Theory●

Bernstein and research●

The Pedagogic Device●

Written by a leading authority in the field, this text will be valuable reading for post-graduate students of
sociology and education, along with active researchers and their research students.
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From reader reviews:

Jennifer Tomasini:

Book is actually written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can realize everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. As you may know that book is important factor to bring us around the
world. Next to that you can your reading ability was fluently. A reserve Basil Bernstein: The thinker and the
field will make you to end up being smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know about almost
everything. But some of you think this open or reading the book make you bored. It is not necessarily make
you fun. Why they might be thought like that? Have you searching for best book or appropriate book with
you?

Sally Norman:

As people who live in often the modest era should be change about what going on or details even knowledge
to make all of them keep up with the era that is certainly always change and progress. Some of you maybe
can update themselves by examining books. It is a good choice for you but the problems coming to anyone is
you don't know which you should start with. This Basil Bernstein: The thinker and the field is our
recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why, because this book serves what you want and
need in this era.

Clara Gay:

Reading a book for being new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to examine a book. When you
go through a book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your
knowledge, simply because book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on
what types of book that you have read. If you want to get information about your analysis, you can read
education books, but if you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, these kinds of us novel,
comics, and soon. The Basil Bernstein: The thinker and the field will give you new experience in studying a
book.

Lisa Robinson:

This Basil Bernstein: The thinker and the field is brand new way for you who has interest to look for some
information since it relief your hunger of information. Getting deeper you on it getting knowledge more you
know or you who still having little bit of digest in reading this Basil Bernstein: The thinker and the field can
be the light food for yourself because the information inside this specific book is easy to get by anyone.
These books create itself in the form that is reachable by anyone, yeah I mean in the e-book application form.
People who think that in book form make them feel drowsy even dizzy this e-book is the answer. So there
isn't any in reading a book especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for you
actually. So , don't miss the item! Just read this e-book type for your better life and also knowledge.
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