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This comprehensive book provides an overview of the key techniques used in the fabrication of micron-scale
structures in silicon. Recent advances in these techniques have made it possible to create a new generation of
microsystem devices, such as microsensors, accelerometers, micropumps, and miniature robots. The authors
underpin the discussion of each technique with a brief review of the fundamental physical and chemical
principles involved. They pay particular attention to methods such as isotropic and anisotropic wet chemical
etching, wafer bonding, reactive ion etching, and surface micromachining. There is a special section on bulk
micromachining, and the authors also discuss release mechanisms for movable microstructures. The book is
a blend of detailed experimental and theoretical material, and will be of great interest to graduate students
and researchers in electrical engineering and materials science whose work involves the study of micro-
electromechanical systems (MEMS).
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From reader reviews:

Steven Whitney:

Do you certainly one of people who can't read pleasant if the sentence chained in the straightway, hold on
guys that aren't like that. This Silicon Micromachining (Cambridge Studies in Semiconductor Physics and
Microelectronic Engineering) book is readable simply by you who hate those straight word style. You will
find the info here are arrange for enjoyable reading experience without leaving perhaps decrease the
knowledge that want to supply to you. The writer connected with Silicon Micromachining (Cambridge
Studies in Semiconductor Physics and Microelectronic Engineering) content conveys objective easily to
understand by a lot of people. The printed and e-book are not different in the content material but it just
different available as it. So , do you even now thinking Silicon Micromachining (Cambridge Studies in
Semiconductor Physics and Microelectronic Engineering) is not loveable to be your top collection reading
book?

Bernice Mignone:

This book untitled Silicon Micromachining (Cambridge Studies in Semiconductor Physics and
Microelectronic Engineering) to be one of several books in which best seller in this year, that's because when
you read this guide you can get a lot of benefit in it. You will easily to buy this kind of book in the book
retail outlet or you can order it via online. The publisher with this book sells the e-book too. It makes you
quicker to read this book, since you can read this book in your Smart phone. So there is no reason for you to
past this e-book from your list.

Jeri McKeen:

The reserve with title Silicon Micromachining (Cambridge Studies in Semiconductor Physics and
Microelectronic Engineering) contains a lot of information that you can discover it. You can get a lot of
profit after read this book. This kind of book exist new know-how the information that exist in this e-book
represented the condition of the world now. That is important to yo7u to find out how the improvement of
the world. This kind of book will bring you inside new era of the syndication. You can read the e-book on
the smart phone, so you can read this anywhere you want.

Barbara Robbins:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you will
get it in e-book means, more simple and reachable. This particular Silicon Micromachining (Cambridge
Studies in Semiconductor Physics and Microelectronic Engineering) can give you a lot of friends because by
you checking out this one book you have point that they don't and make an individual more like an
interesting person. This kind of book can be one of a step for you to get success. This book offer you
information that possibly your friend doesn't know, by knowing more than other make you to be great
persons. So , why hesitate? Let us have Silicon Micromachining (Cambridge Studies in Semiconductor



Physics and Microelectronic Engineering).
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