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John Templer has written the first theoretical, historical, and scientific analysis of one of the most basic and
universal building elements: the stair. Together, these two volumes present a detailed study of stairs and
ramps -- the art and science of their design, their history, and their hazards.

For the designer and the art and architectural historian, the first volume treats the fascinating history of stairs
and their immense influence on the art and science of architecture. It is illustrated with more than 100
photographs from around the world and reviews the literature on stairs (as well as ladders and railings and
ramps) from Vitruvius to Venturi. Templer considers the whole play of meanings in the idea of the stair -- as
art object, as structural idea, as legal prescription, or as poetic fancy -- making it clear that the stair is
simultaneously an aesthetic, architectonic, ergonomic, and cultural element. The second volume shows the
dangers stairs present. Drawing on twenty years of human factors research on stairs, Templer sets out what is
known about slips, trips, and falls and how best to design stairs to avoid their inherent dangers. He discusses
the physiological and behavioral relationship between humans and stairs and walkways, the question of gait
and slippery surfaces, and the various types of falls and the injuries that result. Perhaps most importantly,
Templer proposes the idea of the soft stair, which could substantially reduce the annual epidemic of stair-
related deaths and injuries.
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From reader reviews:

Harry Blalock:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important thing
for us to be aware of everything in the world. Each publication has different aim as well as goal; it means
that book has different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. They are
reading whatever they get because their hobby is actually reading a book. Consider the person who don't like
reading a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book once they found difficult problem or even
exercise. Well, probably you should have this The Staircase: Studies of Hazards, Falls, and Safer Design.

Phyllis Granger:

Book is definitely written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a
book. Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important thing to bring us around the
world. Adjacent to that you can your reading ability was fluently. A publication The Staircase: Studies of
Hazards, Falls, and Safer Design will make you to end up being smarter. You can feel a lot more confidence
if you can know about everything. But some of you think which open or reading a new book make you
bored. It is far from make you fun. Why they might be thought like that? Have you searching for best book
or suited book with you?

Rachel Morris:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be upgrade about what going on or details even
knowledge to make these keep up with the era that is always change and move ahead. Some of you maybe
will probably update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the
problems coming to a person is you don't know which you should start with. This The Staircase: Studies of
Hazards, Falls, and Safer Design is our recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why, as this book
serves what you want and wish in this era.

Phillip Elliott:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information much
easier to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, classifieds,
book, and soon. You can see that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The particular book
that recommended to your account is The Staircase: Studies of Hazards, Falls, and Safer Design this guide
consist a lot of the information with the condition of this world now. This specific book was represented just
how can the world has grown up. The vocabulary styles that writer value to explain it is easy to understand.
The writer made some study when he makes this book. Here is why this book suited all of you.
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