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For the first time in a single volume, Kenneth Woodward presents both the familiar and more obscure
miracle stories of the great saints, sages, and spiritual masters of Christianity, Judaism, Buddhism, Hinduism,
and Islam -- and explains their meaning in the context of the sacred scriptures of each tradition. The Book of
Miracles charts a journey from ancient to modern -- from the Prophet Muhammad's healing of the sick and
the workings of Moses, Elijah, and Elisha to those of the Lubavitcher rebbe Menachem Mendel Schneerson
and the female Hindu sat guru Ammachi. In bringing together stories of the Talmudic wonder-workers, the
first Christian hermits, early Sufi mystics, Muslim ascetics and martyrs, and the most revered Hindu and
Buddhist saints, Woodward illuminates both the striking similarities and significant differences in each
tradition's understanding of the miraculous.
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From reader reviews:

Wanda Mason:

The book The Book of Miracles: The Meaning of the Miracle Stories in Christianity, Judaism, Buddhism,
Hinduism and Islam can give more knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you
want. So just why must we leave a very important thing like a book The Book of Miracles: The Meaning of
the Miracle Stories in Christianity, Judaism, Buddhism, Hinduism and Islam? Some of you have a different
opinion about publication. But one aim which book can give many facts for us. It is absolutely correct. Right
now, try to closer using your book. Knowledge or facts that you take for that, you may give for each other;
you may share all of these. Book The Book of Miracles: The Meaning of the Miracle Stories in Christianity,
Judaism, Buddhism, Hinduism and Islam has simple shape nevertheless, you know: it has great and large
function for you. You can search the enormous world by wide open and read a reserve. So it is very
wonderful.

Dominick Tran:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book to see? May be the book with the concept The Book of
Miracles: The Meaning of the Miracle Stories in Christianity, Judaism, Buddhism, Hinduism and Islam
suitable to you? The particular book was written by well-known writer in this era. The particular book
untitled The Book of Miracles: The Meaning of the Miracle Stories in Christianity, Judaism, Buddhism,
Hinduism and Islamis a single of several books that will everyone read now. This specific book was inspired
many people in the world. When you read this e-book you will enter the new age that you ever know
previous to. The author explained their idea in the simple way, so all of people can easily to know the core of
this book. This book will give you a wide range of information about this world now. So that you can see the
represented of the world on this book.

Kevin Williams:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their leisure time with their family, or
their friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, likely to beach, or picnic from the
park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Do you wish to something different to fill your
own personal free time/ holiday? May be reading a book might be option to fill your free time/ holiday. The
first thing you will ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you want to test look for book,
may be the guide untitled The Book of Miracles: The Meaning of the Miracle Stories in Christianity,
Judaism, Buddhism, Hinduism and Islam can be fine book to read. May be it is usually best activity to you.

Lawrence Pomerleau:

Reading can called thoughts hangout, why? Because while you are reading a book mainly book entitled The
Book of Miracles: The Meaning of the Miracle Stories in Christianity, Judaism, Buddhism, Hinduism and
Islam your brain will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in most aspect that maybe unidentified



for but surely will become your mind friends. Imaging every single word written in a book then become one
web form conclusion and explanation that maybe you never get previous to. The The Book of Miracles: The
Meaning of the Miracle Stories in Christianity, Judaism, Buddhism, Hinduism and Islam giving you a
different experience more than blown away your head but also giving you useful info for your better life in
this era. So now let us demonstrate the relaxing pattern this is your body and mind will be pleased when you
are finished looking at it, like winning a. Do you want to try this extraordinary investing spare time activity?
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