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William Jesse McDonald, known as Captain Bill McDonald (1852– 1918), was a Texas Ranger who served
briefly as a bodyguard for both U.S. Presidents Theodore Roosevelt and Woodrow Wilson, opponents, along
with incumbent President William Howard Taft, in the bitter 1912 United States presidential election.

Captain BILL is an excellent man, and one of the most unobtrusive people ever. The point about him is that
he is efficient. and, like other efficient men, he works with the minimum of noise and display. Captain
BlLL’s remarkable qualities are all qualities of the spirit. He has no show-bill clothes, no display-head
sombrero (Rhode Island size), no monumental legs. Captain BILL is a discreet, efficient instrument of
justice. His line is not clothes, but character. His specialty is order. Think of the debt this country has
incurred within five years to its discreet instruments of justice. It is a mighty high calling in these days to be
a discreet and efficient instrument of justice. But Texas, they say, is pretty well cleaned up.

This book originally published by J.J. Little & Ives Company in 1909 has been reformatted for the Kindle
and may contain an occasional defect from the original publication or from the reformatting.
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From reader reviews:

Shawn Hunter:

Within other case, little people like to read book Captain Bill McDonald, Texas Ranger: A Story of Frontier
Reform. You can choose the best book if you like reading a book. As long as we know about how is
important any book Captain Bill McDonald, Texas Ranger: A Story of Frontier Reform. You can add
knowledge and of course you can around the world by way of a book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from
book you can know everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you may be known. About simple
point until wonderful thing you are able to know that. In this era, we could open a book or even searching by
internet system. It is called e-book. You can use it when you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's
study.

Andrew Martin:

Book is actually written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can learn everything you want by a reserve.
Book has a different type. As we know that book is important matter to bring us around the world. Alongside
that you can your reading skill was fluently. A e-book Captain Bill McDonald, Texas Ranger: A Story of
Frontier Reform will make you to become smarter. You can feel considerably more confidence if you can
know about almost everything. But some of you think this open or reading some sort of book make you
bored. It is not necessarily make you fun. Why they are often thought like that? Have you trying to find best
book or acceptable book with you?

Gina Reiter:

Book is to be different for each and every grade. Book for children until adult are different content. We all
know that that book is very important for us. The book Captain Bill McDonald, Texas Ranger: A Story of
Frontier Reform ended up being making you to know about other know-how and of course you can take
more information. It doesn't matter what advantages for you. The guide Captain Bill McDonald, Texas
Ranger: A Story of Frontier Reform is not only giving you considerably more new information but also
being your friend when you experience bored. You can spend your own personal spend time to read your
guide. Try to make relationship using the book Captain Bill McDonald, Texas Ranger: A Story of Frontier
Reform. You never experience lose out for everything in the event you read some books.

Christopher Rangel:

The book Captain Bill McDonald, Texas Ranger: A Story of Frontier Reform has a lot details on it. So when
you check out this book you can get a lot of gain. The book was published by the very famous author. Tom
makes some research before write this book. This kind of book very easy to read you can get the point easily
after scanning this book.
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