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It all ends here! After his son Robin's body is stolen by alien hordes, Batman finds himself on the deadly
planet of Apokolips—home planet of the murderous despot Darkseid! Aided by his allies Red Hood, Batgirl
and Red Robin, Bruce Wayne must face down the most powerful villains in the universe to recover his son's
coffin—a son who he'd do anything to bring back.

But on a hellish planet, light years from Earth, has that wish come true? Has Robin risen?

The final chapter of a two-year storyline comes to a close here in BATMAN AND ROBIN VOL. 7: ROBIN
RISES, by the New York Times best-selling team of Peter J. Tomasi and Patrick Gleason. Also featuring
illustrations from legendary artist Andy Kubert. Collects BATMAN AND ROBIN #35-40, ROBIN RISES:
ALPHA #1, BATMAN AND ROBIN ANNUAL #3 and stories from SECRET ORIGINS #4.
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From reader reviews:

Carla Smith:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also work as a life style. This reading habit give you lot of
advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside the book
which improve your knowledge and information. The information you get based on what kind of guide you
read, if you want attract knowledge just go with knowledge books but if you want sense happy read one with
theme for entertaining including comic or novel. The actual Batman and Robin Vol. 7: Robin Rises (The
New 52) (Batman & Robin (Numbered)) is kind of e-book which is giving the reader capricious experience.

Daniele Chambers:

The particular book Batman and Robin Vol. 7: Robin Rises (The New 52) (Batman & Robin (Numbered))
has a lot details on it. So when you check out this book you can get a lot of advantage. The book was
compiled by the very famous author. The writer makes some research previous to write this book. This book
very easy to read you can find the point easily after perusing this book.

Irma Tijerina:

Precisely why? Because this Batman and Robin Vol. 7: Robin Rises (The New 52) (Batman & Robin
(Numbered)) is an unordinary book that the inside of the reserve waiting for you to snap the idea but latter it
will distress you with the secret that inside. Reading this book adjacent to it was fantastic author who also
write the book in such incredible way makes the content on the inside easier to understand, entertaining
approach but still convey the meaning thoroughly. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this any
more or you going to regret it. This amazing book will give you a lot of gains than the other book have got
such as help improving your talent and your critical thinking method. So , still want to delay having that
book? If I were you I will go to the e-book store hurriedly.

Larry Strickland:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to opt for book
like comic, brief story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not attempting Batman and Robin Vol. 7:
Robin Rises (The New 52) (Batman & Robin (Numbered)) that give your satisfaction preference will be
satisfied simply by reading this book. Reading routine all over the world can be said as the method for
people to know world better then how they react when it comes to the world. It can't be stated constantly that
reading habit only for the geeky person but for all of you who wants to always be success person. So , for
every you who want to start studying as your good habit, you can pick Batman and Robin Vol. 7: Robin
Rises (The New 52) (Batman & Robin (Numbered)) become your own personal starter.
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